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Martin Peter <martinpeter @patriciancollege.ac.

» and Death Benefits Settlements Initiation Request - Dr. S. Nagajothi

@patriciancollege.ac.in> Tue, Oct 19, 2021 at 10:46 £
atriciancollege.ac.in>

grrespondent <dire
i Peter <martinpete

---------- Forwarded message -
From: Nagajothi § <

Date: Mon, Oct 18, 2021 at 11:32 AM

Subject; Service and Death Benefits Settlements Initiation Request - Dr

S. Nagajothy

Dear Sir/Madam

First of all. | would like to thank your esteemed institution for being a great support to my wife Late Dr S. Nagajothi during
ily from the bottom our heart would likg to express our ¢ o all

as afam

her service and bringing the best out of her Also, w
of wou for the fervent prayers during our most difficult time

'

| Lenin. husband of Late Dr. S Nagajouri, request you 10 kindly initiate the

-
As part of completing the departing formalities
settlement process of 'Service and Death Benefits' - Gratuity, EPF, EDLI, EPS and othgrs.

Please do let me know what needs to be done from my side. Due to leave issues gt workplace, | might not be able to come If
person everytime but will make sure that the nee iful is done on time for smooth procegsing Thanking you again for your

understanding and support

Thanks and Regards

Lenin. S

Mobile . 9176550081




eSO
;-C %L NAAC - AQAR 6.3.1 Welfare Measures - Teaching and Non-Teaching
i i 63 Faculty Empowerment Strategies 2021-2022

i

eSS OF
e 12,

Patrician College of Arts and Science

@
-

= o A Christian Minonty Institubon
- o ’ ]
1 2 A Sister Institute of St. Michael's Academy and St. Patrick’s A.l. Hr Sec School
- =
% ;f ‘ Approved by the Govt. Of Tamilnadu (G.O, No 168) & Affiliated to the University of Madras
— o eaccredited ‘A+" Grade by NAAC
SO Canal Bank Road, Gandhl Nagar, Adyar, Chennai - 600 020

Phone: 044 - 24401362, 24426913, 9342465500
Emall | director@patriciancoliege.ac in, p palriciancoliege.ac.in

vl
Website: hitp://www patric llege.ac.in

To -
The Manager
Urmion Bank of India
- St Michae!'s Academy Branch
»'\4:-’;;' Chennai - 20
Dear Madam
Sub Payment through RTGS
am ssina herewit! f bearing the No 053485 dated 26 10 2021 for Rs 540 907
(Rug vé Lakhs Forty N ind Nine Hundred and Seven Only) favouring Mr Lenin
| request you to make the payment through RTGS with the details given bélow
> NAME Mr.Lenin
AJC No 40380755222
BANK State Bank of India, Gandhi Nagar. Adya
FSC Code SBINOQ17871
hanking vou
Yours Truly
Bro Dr. S Arockiara
Correspondent
»
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